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ACCUZIP ACHIEVES RECERTIFICATION IN DATA SECURITY 

Company is named as SOC2 Type 1 certified in Security, Confidentiality and Availability 
 

ATASCADERO, CA – AccuZIP, a national software company based in Atascadero, CA, 
has recently been recertified in Service Organization Control 2 (SOC2) Type 1 in 
Security, Confidentiality and Availability after a rigorous auditing process.  
 
Applications and software developed by a SOC 2 certified organization must be 
developed following specific processes and controls. This process ensures that products 
are developed, reviewed, tested, and released following the AICPA Trust Services 
Principles. The result is an application that has been developed under an audited 
processes and controls to help ensure the highest level of trust and security.  
 
According to CEO Steve Belmonte, “Our industry has set very high standards for 
security, availability, and confidentiality. Getting our recertification is an important 
validation we are serious about protecting our clients confidential information and that 
our services exceed their expectations and have strict standards for availability.” 
 
AccuZIP, Inc. is a national direct mail software company based in Atascadero, CA. 
AccuZIP provides solutions to manage Contact Data Quality, Address Hygiene, USPS 
Postal Presorting and Compliance and Mail Tracking and Reporting. Since 1992, AccuZIP 
has been the leading provider of data quality software incorporating their core values of 
service, loyalty, innovation, excellence and integrity.  
 
AccuZIP’s most recent mailing software, AccuZIP6, was named 2014 Product of the 
Year by EPICOM, formerly known as AMSP/NAPL/NAQP. The award is presented to a 
company that has produced a product that improves product offerings, profitability, or 
customer service and satisfaction in the commercial print market.  
 
"AccuZIP represents the very best qualities of the kind of creative and innovative 
vendor on whom our members and industry rely," said Mitch Evans, NAQP managing 
director, and vice president of EPICOM, formerly AMSP/NAQP/NAPL. "AccuZIP was 
founded in 1992 and has led the industry as a creative and strategic thinking 
organization. They have provided software solutions designed to be fully functional and 
feature rich yet extremely cost effective.”  
 
For more information visit: http://www.accuzip.com/index.htm  
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